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Abstract. Today, social media is a well-known topic for 
anybody who lives in an online world. This is 
especially true for Croatian youth who spend at least 
some time on social media platforms. These platforms 
can be used in a variety of ways, and everyone uses 

them in their own unique way. Social media allows 
users to contact with other users, leave their mark on 
the internet, participate in online discussions, and do a 
variety of other activities. Croatian youth were online 
polled on their own social media usage, their habits 
and communication patterns on their preferred social 

media platforms, and how frequently they encounter 
specific behavior from them or other users, using a 
Google Forms form. The convenience sampling 
approach was used to select the sample, which 
consisted of people who were simple for the researcher 
to reach. It would be interesting to see if the sampled 

group exhibits the same behaviors on social media 
both for themselves and for others. In light of this, it 
begs the question of whether Croatian youth, who make 
up the sampling group, act similarly to normal social 
media users around the world. Investigating which 
social media platforms are most popular among the 

population and how those platforms relate to those 
used by the majority of social media users 
internationally, and by young people worldwide, is 
performed with the aim to learn more about Croatian 
youths’ digital habits. 
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